



GIG
CYMRU
NHS
WALES

Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol
Cwm Taf Morgannwg
University Health Board



Freedom of Information Request: Our Reference CTMUHB_58_26

You asked:

I am writing to request aggregated information relating to serious incidents, internal reviews, or external investigations involving surgery at Cwm Taf Morgannwg University Health Board during the period **January 1st 1990 - January 1st 1997**.

Please confirm:

1. Whether any serious incident investigations, clinical reviews, or external inquiries were conducted relating to this specialty during that period.
2. Whether any patterns of concern were identified relating to surgical practice or patient safety.
3. Whether any departmental or governance actions were taken as a result.

Our response:

Cwm Taf Morgannwg University Health Board was not established until April 2019 and following a search of our records we can confirm that we do not hold the information for the time period requested.

Datix (digital risk and incident reporting platform) was not introduced into the former North Glamorgan NHS Trust or the Pontypridd and Rhondda NHS Trust until approximately 2002. This means that the electronic incident reporting system used by Cwm Taf Morgannwg University Health Board today was not in place during the period covered by your request (1 January 1990 – 1 January 1997).

As this timeframe is now between 29 and 36 years in the past, the Health Board does not hold any incident information from this period within Datix or within any earlier iterations of the RLDatix system.