
 
 

 

 

 
  

Freedom of Information Request:  Our Reference CTMUHB_128_26 
 

You asked:  

If you use software for the workforce systems below – please could you 
provide the software provider name, contract start date, contract end 

date and total spend in the last year?  

1. Multi-Source Feedback - Medics (examples: L2P, RLDatix, SARD, 

PremierIT, etc.) –  

• Software provider name 
• Contract start date 

• Contract end date 

• Total spend in the last year 

Orbit360, all-Wales e-system hosted and managed by Health Education and 
Improvement Wales (HEIW) – details can be found here HEIW.  

Launched March 2020.  
No end date or cost to use.  

2. Appraisals - Medics (examples: L2P, RLDatix, 14Fish, PremierIT, 

etc.)  

• Software provider name 

• Contract start date 
• Contract end date 

• Total spend in the last year 

Medial MARS, all-Wales e-system hosted and managed by HEIW (as above).  

Current version launched August 2017.  
No end date or cost to use.  

3. E-Rostering - Nurses (examples: RLDatix, Rotamap, HealthRota, 

Patchwork Health, etc.)  

I can confirm that the Health Board does not hold the information that you 

require.  This data would need to be provided by the NHS Wales Shared 
Services Partnership (NWSSP). Your request therefore would need to be 

redirected to NWSSP.  
 

Their contact details can be found via the following link: 
shared.services@wales.nhs.uk 

4. E-Rostering - Medics (examples: RLDatix, Rotamap, HealthRota, 

Patchwork Health, etc.)  

The 2024/25 spend for Medics on Duty was £64,317.00 (£77,180.40 inc. 

VAT). 

https://heiw.nhs.wales/
mailto:shared.services@wales.nhs.uk


 
 

 

5. E-Rostering - AHP (examples: RLDatix, Rotamap, HealthRota, 

Patchwork Health, etc.)  

I can confirm that the Health Board does not hold the information that you 

require.  This data would need to be provided by the NHS Wales Shared 
Services Partnership (NWSSP). Your request therefore would need to be 

redirected to NWSSP. 

Their contact details can be found via the following link: 

shared.services@wales.nhs.uk 

6. Job Planning - Medics (examples: RLDatix, SARD, L2P, HealthRota, 

etc.)  

Please provide the name of the software provider or service 
provider directly. Please don't include resellers like Boxxe, Softcat, 

CCS frameworks etc. If you don't use a system you can say NONE.  

2025/25 spend for ejobPlan was £55,742.00 (£66,890.40 inc. VAT). 
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