



GIG
CYMRU
NHS
WALES

Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol
Cwm Taf Morgannwg
University Health Board



Freedom of Information Request: Our Reference CTMUHB_246_26

You asked:

I'm getting in touch to submit a Freedom of Information request regarding the workforce systems used at your Trust.

For each of the areas listed below, I'd be grateful if you could share the following details:

- Name of the software or service provider
- Contract start date
- Contract end date
- Total spend over the last year

The areas I'm asking about are:

1. Bank (Tech) - Nurses (e.g. Locum's Nest, Patchwork Health, BankPartners, Agile LMS, etc.)

The specific information that you have requested would be held by [NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership \(NWSSP\)](#) whom provides procurement services for all Wales NHS Health Boards.

Therefore, you may wish to redirect your request to NWSSP, they can be contacted at the following address:

shared.services@wales.nhs.uk

2. Bank (Tech) - Admin and Clerical (e.g. Locum's Nest, Patchwork Health, BankPartners, Agile LMS, etc.)

We can confirm that there is no tech for admin and therefore, we do not hold this information.

3. Job Planning - AHP (e.g. SARD, L2P, Zircadian, RLDatix, etc.)

We can confirm that AHPs do not have Job Plans and therefore we do not hold this information.

4. Bank (Tech) - AHP (e.g. Locum's Nest, Patchwork Health, BankPartners, Agile LMS, etc.)

The specific information that you have requested would be held by [NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership \(NWSSP\)](#) whom provides procurement services for all Wales NHS Health Boards.

Therefore, you may wish to redirect your request to NWSSP, they can be contacted at the following address:

shared.services@wales.nhs.uk