



GIG
CYMRU
NHS
WALES

Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol
Cwm Taf Morgannwg
University Health Board



Freedom of Information Request: Our Reference CTMUHB_130_25

Thank you for your request for information received on the 10 March 2025, regarding Outpatient Psychiatry Appointment Costs. Please find the response from Cwm Taf Morgannwg University Health Board set out below:

You asked:

I am writing to submit a Freedom of Information request regarding the costs associated with outpatient psychiatry assessments and appointments commissioned by your authority.

Specifically, I would be grateful if you could provide the following information for the most recent financial year available.

Our response:

1. The total spending by the ICB on outpatient psychiatry appointments.

£18.041m

2. The average cost per assessment/appointment for the following outpatient psychiatry services:

- ADHD assessments
- Autism Spectrum Disorder (ASD) assessments
- General mental health assessments
- Drug and alcohol assessments
- Child psychiatry assessments
- Follow-up psychiatry appointments

We do not hold the level of data requested, however we can provide average costs as per the below split:

Service	Face To Face	
	First £	Follow-Up £
Mental illness	138.83	84.54
Child and adolescent psychiatry	1,008.05	444.59
Old age psychiatry	303.45	233.26

3. If available, a breakdown of the above costs distinguishing between assessments carried out by NHS providers and those commissioned from private providers.

We do not hold this information.