



GIG
CYMRU
NHS
WALES

Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol
Cwm Taf Morgannwg
University Health Board



Freedom of Information Request: Our Reference CTMUHB_60_25

You asked:

Please could you provide me with the following information:

1. How many people currently classed as urgent are awaiting full knee replacement in Cwm Taff Morgannwg Health Board?

278.

Noting - Census Date 31/01/2025.

2. How many full knee replacements took place between September 2024 and January 2025 in Cwm Taff Health Board?

100.

Noting the following:

- Where data is reliant on clinical coding, there is a delay. Therefore, data may be incomplete.
- Patients also could still be admitted and coding of spell incomplete.

3. What was the average wait for a total knee replacement treated in 2024 in Cwm Taff Morgannwg Health Board?

539 days / 77 weeks.

Noting the following:

- Where data is reliant on clinical coding, there is a delay. Therefore, data may be incomplete.
- Patients also could still be admitted and coding of spell incomplete.
- They could also be in process of being treated to be taken off the list.

4. How many people are currently waiting full knee replacements in

- Royal Glam,
- POW
- Prince Charles
- NPT

And how many are classed as urgent in each area

	Currently waiting	Urgent
Royal Glam	418	159
POW	0	
Prince Charles	458	119
NPT	CTMUHB does not hold this information. NPT comes under the Swansea Bay University Health Board (SBUHB) area. Therefore this element of	

5. How many full knee replacement surgeries were cancelled in 2024

164.

6. How many patients awaiting full knee replacement have more than one pre op consultation prior to op because they have waited longer than 6 months and it has lapsed

We can confirm that the Health Board does not hold this data in a way that it can be easily extracted. The information you require would be recorded within an individual patient's health record as part of their ongoing care. To provide you with this information, would require a manual trawl to extract, review and validate the data and would significantly exceed the 18 hours time and £450 cost limit set out within Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act.

7. How many people within the Bridgend council boundary had a total knee replacement between Oct 24 and Jan 25

12.

Noting the following:

- Where data is reliant on clinical coding, there is a delay. Therefore, data may be incomplete.
- Patients also could still be admitted and coding of spell incomplete.

8. How many people within RCT had a total knee replacement between Oct 24 and Jan 25

6.

Noting the following:

- Where data is reliant on clinical coding, there is a delay. Therefore, data may be incomplete.
- Patients also could still be admitted and coding of spell incomplete.