



GIG
CYMRU
NHS
WALES

Bwrdd Iechyd Prifysgol
Cwm Taf Morgannwg
University Health Board



Freedom of Information Request: Our Reference CTMUHB_54_25

You asked:

Given the recent freezing order in HMRC v Ducas Ltd, Enix Services, and FL Capital holdings can I ask the following:

1. Name of agencies who have supplied nurses or are supplying the health board under the current all Wales contact.

Please see information provided in the table below:

Supplying Agency
MPS Healthcare
Your World Recruitment Ltd
Immediate Medical Solutions LTD
Enferm Medical Ltd
Swiis Foster Care LTD (T/A Swiis Healthcare)
DRC Locums Ltd
RMR Recruitment Limited
ID Medical Group Limited
MedicsPro Limited
Nos Da Healthcare LTD
Capital Staffing Services
Bluestones Medical
Direct Nursing Services Ltd
Goldstaff Recruitment
Medilink Consulting Limited
Mylocum Ltd
Total Assist Recruitment
Med Team Primary Care Services
Next Step Nursing
Richmond
HCRG
MedPure LTD
Daytime Healthcare Recruitment LTD
ELEVENTH HOUR GROUP LTD
CarePro Ltd
Vetro Recruitment LTD
Randstad Care Limited
Workforce Employment Solutions LTD
Care Providers Recruitment LTD
Locum Placement Group LTD
Procure Nursing Ltd
CAMHS Professionals
Just Nurses
Pulse Healthcare LTD

ASA Medical Solutions LTD
Medical Professional Personnel LTD (T/A Nursing Personnel)
Spectrum Healthcare Domicilliary Care
Pro Nursing Healthcare
Hoop Recruitment T/A Hoop Nursing
Seven Resourcing
IMC Locums LTD
Medsol Healthcare Services Ltd
Interact Medical LTD
Medacs
YourNurse
MRecruitment Ltd
Nisi Enterprises LTD Trading
National Locums Ltd
Concept Care Solutions

2. Name of agencies that have or do use Maxipay Accounting Services or and of the services Enix/Ducas/FL services during the duration of the current contact.

We can confirm that the Health Board does not record this information. It is for individual agencies to pay their staff in the way they decide. Agency nurses are employees of the agency not the Health Board.

3. Number of agency nurses working at the health board in the last 12 months.

1303.

4. Number of those nurses who hold a Ltd Company on companies house and use an agency that uses Maxipay.

Please see response to Q1. This is not something that the Health Board would be required to record or know about.

5. Please confirm if agencies supply nurses are asked to confirm that they do not pay into PSC, and the response from any agency that uses Maxipay.

The Health Board does not hold this information.

[NHS Wales Shared Services Partnership \(NWSSP\)](#) provides procurement and Payroll services for all Wales NHS Health Boards and may be able to provide further information.

They can be contacted at the following address:
shared.services@wales.nhs.uk