

Freedom of Information Request: Our Reference CTMUHB_127_24

You asked:

This is a freedom of information request under the Freedom of Information Act 2000. Please provide the following information you have pertaining to care provision for adults (ages 18+) with dementia or mental health needs:

Number of service users: younger adults (18-64)

1. The total number of younger adults (18-64) with dementia or mental health needs that in a care home service with nursing as of 31 March 2023, by average weekly fee (please fill in the table below). If there are service users that are co-funded by the LA and NHS, please only include those where you are the primary funder (i.e. fund $\geq 50\%$ of the care).

Can you please indicate if these are 'in area' or 'out of area' placements. By out of area, we mean where an individual is receiving care outside of the catchment area of the commissioning locality. If this is not possible, please provide the total number of service users.

	Number of service users by average weekly fee/cost of care (e.g. paid to residential care provider)			
	Less than £1,000	£1,000-£2,499	£2,500-£4,999	More than £5,000
In area – care home service with nursing				
Out of area – care home service with nursing				
Total				

We do not categorise information by age. Therefore, we are unable to provide the requested information.

2. Please fill in the table above table again but with the corresponding information as of 31 March 2021
3. Please fill in the table above table again but with the corresponding information as of 31 March 2019

The Health Board does not hold this data.

Number of service users: older adults (65+)

4. The total number of older adults (65+) with dementia or mental health needs in a care home service with nursing as of 31 March 2023, by average weekly fee (please fill in the table below). If there are service users that are co-funded by the LA and NHS, please only include those where you are the primary funder (i.e. fund $\geq 50\%$ of the care).

Can you please indicate if these are 'in area' or 'out of area' placements. By out of area we mean where an individual is receiving care outside of the catchment area of the commissioning locality.

	Number of service users by average weekly fee/cost of care (e.g. paid to residential care provider)			
	Less than £1,000	£1,000-£2,499	£2,500-£4,999	More than £5,000
In area – care home service with nursing				
Out of area – care home service with nursing				
Total				

We do not categorise information by age. Therefore, we are unable to provide the requested information.

5. Please fill in the table above table again but with the corresponding information as of 31 March 2021
6. Please fill in the table above table again but with the corresponding information as of 31 March 2019

The Health Board does not hold this data.

Service users: older adults (65+) in a hospital setting

7. The total number of older adults (65+) with dementia or mental health needs in an inpatient mental health hospital setting as of 31 March 2023.

We can confirm that the Health Board does not centrally record this specific information. The information you require would be recorded within an individual patient's health record as part of their ongoing care. To provide you with this information, would require a manual trawl and significantly exceed the 18 hours time and £450 cost limit set out within Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act.

Spend on services: Adults (aged 18+)

8. Please can you provide total spend by your healthboard on care home services with nursing as of 31 March 2023 for all adults (18+) with dementia or mental health needs, by average weekly fee.

	Average weekly fee/cost of care (e.g. paid to residential care provider)				Total
	Less than £1,000	£1,000-£2,499	£2,500-£4,999	More than £5,000	
Annual spend	1,866,132	4,302,205	3,502,721	0	9,671,058

9. Please fill in the table above table again but with the corresponding information as of 31 March 2021

	Average weekly fee/cost of care (e.g. paid to residential care provider)				Total
	Less than £1,000	£1,000-£2,499	£2,500-£4,999	More than £5,000	
Annual spend	2,836,240	3,773,298	1,423,012	0	8,032,551

10. Please fill in the table above table again but with the corresponding information as of 31 March 2019

	Average weekly fee/cost of care (e.g. paid to residential care provider)				Total
	Less than £1,000	£1,000-£2,499	£2,500-£4,999	More than £5,000	
Annual spend	1,581,275	3,182,556	623,379	0	5,387,209