Freedom of Information Request: Our Reference CTMUHB_489_ 23

You asked:
Please provide:

1.

How many registered OTs are employed in your organisation?
150.89 Whole Time Equivalent (WTE).

How many registered OTs were employed in your organisation in
2018

We do not hold this information.

How many HCPC registered OTs are employed in positions that don't
have occupational therapy in the title

The Health Board does not centrally record this information.

. How many unregistered staff do you have that support OT services

44,98 WTE - OT Technicians / OT Assistants

How many current vacancies do you have for the whole of the OT
service

There are currently 24 OT posts vacant.

What are the current OTs employed within each band 5, 6, 7, 8a,b,c

1 WTE Band 8C
2 WTE Band 8b
7 WTE Band 8a
62.29 WTE B7
60.5 WTE B6
28.1 WTE B5
20.69 WTE B4
14.69 WTE B3
0.6 WTE B2

. Is there data on the age profile for each band and can we have it?

We can confirm that the Health does hold this information. However, to
provide you with this information, would require a manual trawl and
significantly exceed the 18 hours time and £450 cost limit set out within
Section 12 of the Freedom of Information Act.

. What is the longest period within the last year that vacancies have

been unfilled at each band

We do not record this information.

. Current vacancy rates for each band

We do not record this information.



