
 

 

Freedom of Information Request:  Our Reference   CTHB_232_17 
 

You asked:  
   

1. In the first 6 months of 2017, how many nurses, doctors and 
other medical staff have taken a leave of absence from work 

because of a stress related illness? 
 

Our electronic staff record records staff groups Medical and Dental and 

Nursing and Midwifery.  
 

Period 1-1-17 to 30-6-17 

Sickness Reason : S10 Anxiety/stress/depression/other 
psychiatric illnesses 

Staff Group Headcount 

Medical and Dental 8 

Nursing and Midwifery Registered 224 

Grand Total 232 

 
Please note that the sickness reason does not differentiate 

between work-related stress or stress as a result of issues outside 
of the work place. 

 

2. As a result, how much was spent on employing temporary staff 
to cover these absences? 

 
     We do not record this information.  

 

3. In 2016 how many nurses, doctors and other medical staff have 
taken a leave of absence from work because of a stress related 

illness? 
 

Period 1-1-16 to 31-12-16 

Sickness Reason : S10 Anxiety/stress/depression/other 
psychiatric illnesses 

Staff Group Headcount 

Medical and Dental 18 

Nursing and Midwifery Registered 375 

Grand Total 393 

 
Please note that the sickness reason does not differentiate 

between work-related stress or stress as a result of issues outside 
of the work place. 

 

4. As a result, how much was spent on employing temporary staff 
to cover these absences? 

 

 We do not record this information.  


